



Conejo Valley Unified School District

Athletic Field and Parking Lot @ NPH
MP19/20-16-NPH
PRELIMINARY BID RESULTS

Thank you for your desire to participate in the bidding process. All bids will be reviewed for responsiveness of the Bid Proposals submitted, and to determine if the bidders are responsible. The District assumes no liability of miscommunication or misinterpretation of the provided bid results. Upon verification, bid results will be posted on our webpage.

Tuesday, July 28, 2020
DAY / DATE

10:00 a.m.
TIME

5
ISSUED ADDENDA

General Contractors	Ardalan Construction Co	BN Construction	Bobaggar Bldrs	CS Legacy	Chic Constr	Enterprise Constr	FS Contractors	Fence Factory	Finish Line Paving	Hughes Gen Engr	Izurieta Fence	Magnum Fence & Security	Marina Landscape	MVC Enterprises	Ohno Constr	Offield Elect	Quality Paving	Scott and Sons Elect	Staples Constr	Taft Elect	Union Engr	United Const & Landscap	Venco Electric	Zeller Elect
Requirements																								
Contractor License	893121	806551	905498	826870	994455	783613	1005940	275524	1024827	644816	925951	719567	492862	762066	833470	125250	660802	700054	710039	772245	212942	960915	446770	467139
DIR Registration	100000787	1000026326		1000002947	1000411013	1000010886			1000049854				100000079		100000584					100000149				
Attend Mandatory Job Walk	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓
Bid Form	✓	✓	NO BID	✓	✓	✓	NO BID	NO BID	✓	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	✓	NO BID	✓	✓	NO BID	✓	NO BID	✓	NO BID	✓	✓	NO BID
Addenda	1-5	1-5		1-5	1-5	1-5			1-5				1-5		1-5	1-5		1-5		1-5		1-5		
Designation of Subs	✓	✓		✓	✓	✓			✓				✓		✓	✓		✓		✓		✓	✓	
Non Collusion	✓	✓		✓	✓	✓			✓				✓		✓	✓		✓		✓		✓	✓	
Bid Bond	✓	✓		✓	✓	✓			✓				✓		✓	✓		✓		✓		✓	✓	
Pre Qual of Contractor																								
Asphalt Grading																								
Bid	206,000.00	279,000.00		399,575.00	98,000.00				284,143.00															310,000.00
Allowance	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Total Base Bid	\$ 206,000.00	\$ 279,000.00	\$ -	\$ 399,575.00	\$ 98,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 284,143.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Chain Link Fencing																								
Bid	147,000.00			279,142.00																				
Allowance	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Total Base Bid	\$ 147,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 279,142.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Concrete																								
Bid	125,000.00			255,656.00	125,000.00																			
Allowance	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Total Base Bid	\$ 125,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 255,656.00	\$ 125,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Alternate No 1	50,000.00			194,834.00																				75,000.00
Electrical																								
Bid				156,304.00											148,800.00		133,500.00			156,800.00				
Allowance	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Total Base Bid	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 156,304.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 148,800.00	\$ -	\$ 133,500.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 156,800.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Landscaping																								
Bid				218,521.00	185,000.00								117,100.00		392,000.00									218,000.00
Allowance	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Total Base Bid	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 218,521.00	\$ 185,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 117,100.00	\$ -	\$ 392,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 218,000.00
Alternate No 1				61,756.00									56,500.00		38,000.00									284,000.00
Metals, Sheet & Roofing																								
Bid																								
Allowance	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Total Base Bid	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
Alternate No 1																								

The apparent low bid will be based on the lowest total base bid

Opened and Read by:
A. Frutos - Director,
Purchasing